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SECTION 4 
 

Description of the concentration 
 
The proposed transaction concerns the acquisition of indirect joint control by two investment 
funds, TA Associates and Stirling Square Capital Partners, as well as Macquarie European 
Investment Holdings Limited (“MEIHL”) of Byggfakta Group Nordic Holdco AB, including 
each of their subsidiary undertakings (“Byggfakta Group” or the “Target”), (the “Proposed 
Transaction”). The Proposed Transaction thus constitutes a concentration under Article 
3(1)(b) and Article 3(4) of Council Regulation (EC) 139/2004 (“EUMR”). Each of TA 
Associates, SSCP, Macquarie and the Byggfakta Group is a “Party”, together the “Parties”. 
The Proposed Transaction is to be effected by way of a share purchase pursuant to a public 
bid announced on 5 January 2024. 
 
TA Associates 

TA Associates is a global private equity firm based in Boston, Massachusetts, USA. TA 
Associates has portfolio companies active in selected industries, including business services, 
consumer, financial services, healthcare and technologies, operating worldwide. For further 
information, please see: www.ta.com. 
 
SSCP 

SSCP is a private equity firm based in London, UK. SSCP has portfolio companies active 
across a variety of industries technology, infrastructure, education and consumer services. 
SSCP primarily focuses on investments across the European geographic region. For further 
information, please see: www.stirlingsquare.com. 
 
MEIHL 

MEIHL is a fully-owned subsidiary, part of Macquarie Group Limited (“Macquarie”). 
Macquarie is a publicly traded company on the Australian Securities Exchange. The 
Macquarie Group is a global provider of asset management, retail and business banking, 
wealth management, leasing and asset financing, market access, commodity trading, 
renewables development, specialist advisory, capital raising and principal investment 
services. For further information, please see www.macquarie.com. 
 
Byggfakta Group 

Byggfakta Group, headquartered in Sweden, offers customers an integrated data and software 
platform that provides market data and market intelligence servcices to companies in the 
construction, property and healthcare industries. For further information, please see 
www.byggfaktagroup.com.  
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